BID TABULATION

LAKE COUNTY ROAD DEPARTMENT SALT - 2025

LCE Project No. 2025-006

Morton Salt, Inc.
444 \W. Lake Street, STE. 3000
Chicago, IL 60606
PH: 855-655-4540
FX: 312-896-9208

Compass Materials Am., Inc.
9900 West 109th St. Ste. 100
Overland Park, KS 66210
PH: 800-323-1641 Option 2
FX: 913-3388-7945

Cargill, Inc. - Salt, Road §afety
24950 Country Club Blvd., Ste. 450
North Olmstead, Ohio 44070
PH: 800-600-7258
FX: 800-739-8705

Estimated | Measure
Description Quantity Unit Unit Price Item Total Unit Price Item Total Unit Price Item Total
TREATED ROCK SALT
Delivered - Lost Nation Yard 1,800 TON $ 84.271$ 151,686.00 No Bid $ 88.38|$ 159,084.00
Delivered - Painesville Yard 4,200 TON $ 84.271% 353,934.00 No Bid $ 88.38|1$ 371,196.00
Bid Total $ 505,620.00 Bid Total NO BID Bid Total $ 530,280.00
Price per ton if piled at Lost Nation
Yard TON $ 99.27 No Bid $ 98.38
Morton §alt, Inc. Compass Materials Am., Inc. Cargill, Inc. - Salt, Road §afety
444 \W. Lake Street, STE. 3000 9900 West 109th St. Ste. 100 24950 Country Club Blvd., Ste. 450
Chicago, IL 60606 Overland Park, KS 66210 North Olmstead, Ohio 44070
PH: 855-655-4540 PH: 800-323-1641 Option 2 PH: 800-600-7258
FX: 312-896-9208 FX: 913-3388-7945 FX: 800-739-8705
Estimated | Measure
Description Quantity Unit Unit Price Item Total Unit Price Item Total Unit Price Item Total
UNTREATED BULK ROCK SALT
Delivered - Painesville Yard 15,000 TON $ 63.27 | $ 949,050.00 | § 70.94 | $ 1,064,100.00 | $ 71.19 | $ 1,067,850.00
Delivered - Lost Nation Yard 3,000 TON $ 63.27 | $ 189,810.00 | § 7094 | $ 212,820.00 | $ 71.191% 213,570.00
Bid Total $1,138,860.00 Bid Total $1,276,920.00 | Bid Total $1,281,420.00
Price per ton if piled at Lost Nation
Yard TON $ 78.27 $ 85.94 $ 81.19
Price per ton if piled at Painesville
Yard TON $ 78.27 $ 85.94 $ 81.19
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